Culvert Supply 2023

Company Culvert Size Price

J. A. Porter Holdings 10 x 750mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $9,759.42
10 x 450mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $3,858.28
10 x 500mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $4,958.49
10 x 600mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $6,561.12
2 x 450mm x 6m with couplers CSP $1,050.80
3 x 1.8m x 21m with couplers CSP $55,947.69
3 x 1.4m x 19m with couplers CSP $38,459.09
2 x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.4m Arch CSP S$5,863.14
2 x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.7m Arch CSP $6,174.90

Total without HST $132,632.93

Armtec Inc. 10 x 750mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $9,876.00
10 x 450mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $3,924.00
10 x 500mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $5,175.00
10 x 600mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $6,447.00
2 x 450mm x 6m with couplers CSP $1,174.20
3 x 1.8m x 21m with couplers CSP $56,555.10
3 x 1.4m x 19m with couplers CSP $40,173.60
2 x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.4m Arch CSP $7,609.00
2 x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.7m Arch CSP $7,609.00

Total without HST $138,542.90

Carson Supply 10 x 750mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $9,832.26
10 x 450mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $3,906.45
10 x 500mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $5,151.61
10 x 600mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $6,416.13
2 x 450mm x 6m with couplers CSP $1,169.03
3 x 1.8m x 21m with couplers CSP $56,307.10
3 x 1.4m x 19m with couplers CSP $39,995.00




2x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.4m Arch CSP

$7,575.06

2x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.7m Arch CSP $7,575.05
Total without HST $137,927.69
Devron Sales Ltd. 10 x 750mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $10,568.80
10 x 450mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $4,245.70
10 x 500mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $5,541.00
10 x 600mm x 6m with couplers HDPE $7,228.60
2 x 450mm x 6m with couplers CSP $1,177.20
3 x 1.8m x 21m with couplers CSP $61,229.07
3 x 1.4m x 19m with couplers CSP $42,494.64
2 x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.4m Arch CSP $6,477.31
2 x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.7m Arch CSP $6,756.68
Total without HST $145,719.00
Atlantic Industries Ltd. 10 x 750mm x 6m with couplers HDPE No Bid
10 x 450mm x 6m with couplers HDPE No Bid
10 x 500mm x 6m with couplers HDPE No Bid
10 x 600mm x 6m with couplers HDPE No Bid
2 x 450mm x 6m with couplers CSP $1,095.72
3 x 1.8m x 21m with couplers CSP $57,101.31
3 x 1.4m x 19m with couplers CSP $39,629.25
2 x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.4m Arch CSP $6,028.42
2 x1630mm x 1120mm x 6.7m Arch CSP $6,288.49

Total without HST

$110,143.19




